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Sonata Software: Vertical modernization for an enterprise ISV

Source : Zinnov

Why Sonata SoftwareWhy Sonata Software Challenges Solution Benefits

▪ Deep understanding and product 
engineering heritage with expertise in 
software engineering

▪ Has a history of executing 360 degree 
relationships with some of the largest ISV 
customers

▪ Has experience of cloud modernizing 
several ISV solutions including sonata’s 
own vertical and horizontal platforms. 

▪ The enterprise sought modernization of 
multiple ERP products on its legacy 
platforms

▪ The enterprise was faced with budget and 
timeline constraints

▪ Company wanted a partner who 
understands modernization of products in 
cloud and can build knowledge to create 
frameworks to modernize all their product 
portfolio.

▪ Saved of 30% on budgeted estimate and 
speed of delivery

▪ Sonata added several reusable frameworks 
to help speeding up further 
modernizations.

▪ Sonata provides extended support on an 
on-going basis to the enterprise
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▪ Sonata Software provided advisory 
services and defined the digital roadmap 
for the enterprise

▪ It modernized UX using a hybrid cloud 
solution and also acted as integration 
partner for backend systems to enable a 
seamless experience

▪ Sonata Software's services and solutions 
spanned strategy, design, integration, 
testing, and ongoing maintenance. It also 
leverages predictive and prescriptive 
analytics to future proof requirements
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